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  Freedom of Information Request 
 
You asked for the following information from the HM Courts & Tribunals Service (HMCTS):
 
“I request the following information, pursuant to s1 and s7 Freedom of Information Act 2000. to use in this dissertation highlighting changes in the use of the civil litigation process since the introduction of the Civil Procedure Rules 1998.

Requests relating to the issuing of proceedings in the Thanet County Court:

1. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 1996

2. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 1997

3. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 1998

4. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court between  1 January 1999 and 25 April 1999
5. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court between 26 April 1999 and 31 December 1999

6. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2000

7. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2001

8. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2002

9. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2010

10. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2011

11. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2012

12. The number of civil litigation proceedings issued in the Thanet County Court in 2013

Requests relating to proceedings settled by a ‘consent order’ in the Thanet County Court prior to trial:
13. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1996
14. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1997

15. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1998

16. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date between 1 January 1999 and 25 April 1999

17. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date between 26 April 1999 and 31 December 1999

18. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2000

19. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2001

20. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2002

21. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2010

22. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2011

23. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2012

24. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2013

Requests relating to proceedings settled by a ‘consent order’ in the Canterbury County Court prior to trial:

25. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1996
26.  The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1997

27. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 1998

28. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the list trial date between 1 January 1999 and 25 April 1999

29. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date between 26 April 1999 and 31 December 1999
30. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2000

31. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2001

32. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2002

33. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2010

34. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2011

35. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2012

36. The number of civil litigation proceedings settled using a consent order prior to the listed trial date in the year 2013

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

I can confirm that the department holds some of the information that you have asked for, and I am pleased to provide this to you.  I have summarised this information in two tables at the end of this letter. Please note the additional information that provides context for the information disclosed

The information has been obtained by searching an electronic data warehouse that contains information obtained from case records held on our “CASEMAN” computer system. “CASEMAN” is used by court staff to administer county courts cases. Case records are checked for accuracy through sampling activities. However, checks are not performed in every case, so we cannot guarantee the accuracy of the information.
We do not hold accurate information from before 2005. To establish whether the information was held I conducted a thorough search, and made enquires with the Performance, Analysis and Reporting Team within HMCTS. When assessing whether or not information was held adequate and reasonable searches for the requested information were made in their electronic data warehouse. Old, concluded, cases have been removed from the electronic data warehouse that holds this information.  Statistical information from before 2005 is therefore incomplete, and cannot be relied on. 

Information from before 2005 cannot be obtained from the courts. This is because court files are destroyed after 3 years from the date of the last addition to the court files, in accordance with the record retention and disposition schedule for county courts (i.e. the department’s guidelines on what county courts should keep, and for how long).
If the information was held by HMCTS it would have to be held by the above mentioned business area. It may help if I clarify that the information being requested is not held by HMCTS because there is no legal or business requirement for HMCTS to do so.

Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless recorded information exists. The FOIA duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 

You can find out more about information held for the purposes of the Act by reading some guidance points we consider when processing a request for information, attached at the end of this letter. 
I am sorry I cannot provide you with all the information you have requested. However, I hope the information I have provided helps with your dissertation.  You can also find more information by reading the full text of the Act (available at http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents).
EXPLANATION OF INFORMATION HELD FOR THE PURPOSES OF THE ACT
We have provided below additional information for information held for the purposes of the Freedom of Information Act. We have included some of the guidance we use when considering requests for information. I hope you find this information useful.

Is the information 'held' for the purposes of the Act? 

A person may request any information 'held' in any recorded form by a public authority (or held by another on behalf of a public authority). 

If the requester is asking for an opinion on an issue or asking for information that is not already held to be created, this is not a Freedom of Information Act request. 

Information covered by the Act 

All recorded information 'held' by a public authority is within the scope of the Freedom of Information Act. It includes files, letters, emails and photographs and extends to closed files and archived material. 

Recorded information 

The right of access applies to information recorded in any form. This includes: 

· information that is held electronically (such as on a laptop computer or an electronic records management system) 

· information that is recorded on paper (such as a letter, memorandum or papers in a file) 

· sound and video recordings (such as a CD or videotape) 

· hand-written notes or comments, including those written in note pads or on Post-it notes 

Is the information 'held' under the Freedom of Information Act? 

'Holding' information includes holding a copy of a record produced or supplied by someone else. However, if a public authority only holds information on behalf of someone else, for example a department holding trade union information on their computer system, then that public authority may not have to provide the information in response to a Freedom of Information Act request. 

In some cases, it may not be clear whether information which is physically present on your premises or systems is properly to be regarded as 'held' by your public authority, for the purposes of the Freedom of Information Act. Examples include: 

· private material brought into the office by ministers or officials 

· material belonging to other people or bodies 

· trade union material 

· constituency material 

· material relating to party political matters.
Issuing of civil litigation proceedings 

	Number of civil litigation
 proceedings issued in...
	1996 to 2004

	2005
	2006
	2007
	2008
	2009
	2010
	2011
	2012

	2013

	Thanet County Court

	-
	935
	870
	1,189
	852
	704
	398
	436
	122
	10

	Canterbury County Court

	-
	2,496
	2,020
	1,807
	1,648
	2,261
	1,629
	1,460
	425
	67


Civil Litigation proceedings settled by a ‘consent order’
 prior to trial
	Number of civil litigation settled by consider order prior to the listed trial date in ....
	1996 to 2004

	2005
	2006
	2007
	2008
	2009
	2010
	2011
	2012

	2013

	Thanet County Court
	-
	0
	0
	3
	0
	0
	0
	0
	0
	1

	Canterbury County Court
	-
	97
	211
	252
	134
	92
	117
	21
	12
	143


� “Civil litigation” is open to interpretation. It could include, for example, rent or mortgage possessions, personal injury or medical negligence cases.  I note you have stated your interest in the introduction of the Civil Procedural Rules.  The Civil Justice Reforms looked at judicial case management of defended claims, allocating cases to the small, fast and multi-track tracks. The Reforms affected Part 7 Claims more than possession cases. I have therefore provided you with statistics relating to Part 7 Claims.  The case types “CLAIM – SPECIFIED”, CLAIM – UNSPECIFIED” and “PERSONAL INJURY” entered on CASEMAN (the computer system used to administer County Court cases) have been used to identify cases, and so produce these statistics.


� Only data from 2005 onwards can be provided. Statistical information from before 2005 cannot be relied on for accuracy. This is because some old, concluded, cases have been removed from the electronic data warehouse that holds this information.


� The County Court Money Claims Centre handles an increasing amount of cases, and this is reflected in the statistics shown. 


� Only cases issued at Thanet County Court have been included. Cases issued at other courts, then transferred to Thanet County Court, have been excluded


� Only cases issued at Canterbury County Court have been included. Cases issued at other courts, then transferred to Canterbury County Court, have been excluded


�  Court records on CASEMAN are updated with standard codes (“event codes”) that are used to summarise what has taken place on each case, and when. There are two “event codes” that can be used to record consent orders - event code 184 (consent order) and event code: 256 (consent judgment). Only event code 256 (consent judgment) is used for case disposal (i.e. to record when a case is concluded, by consent).  Event code 256 has therefore been used to identify cases settled by a consent order.  Also, please note the consent orders may have been granted before trial dates had been fixed in those cases.


� Only data from 2005 onwards can be provided. Statistical information from before 2005 cannot be relied on for accuracy. This is because some old, concluded, cases have been removed from the electronic data warehouse that holds this information.


� The County Court Money Claims Centre handles an increasing amount of cases, and this is reflected in the statistics shown. 









