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Freedom of Information Request 
You asked for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):
“I’d like to make a Freedom of Information Act answer the following questions:-

-          What percentage of cases heard between January 2010 and December 2013 in the Commercial Court had one or more parties who were non-UK nationals or companies?

-          What percentage of the Commercial Court’s caseload between January 2010 and December 2013 involved one or more parties from Russia, Ukraine, Kazakhstan, Kyrgyzstan, Turkmenistan, Uzbekistan or Belarus?

I appreciate that statistics up to December 2013 may not be finalised so would be happy for you to substitute the nearest most recent date.”
Your request has been passed to me because I have responsibility for answering requests relating to Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunal Service in London and is being handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 

I can confirm that Her Majesty’s Courts & Tribunal Service holds some of the information that you have asked for, and I am pleased to provide this to you. 
The table below shows, for the periods of each financial year from 1st April 2008 to 31st March 2013, statistics in relation to companies outside the United Kingdom in relation to claims issued in the Admiralty, Commercial and Technology Commercial Court in the Rolls Building at the Royal Courts of Justice within Her Majesty’s Courts and Tribunals Service. It may be helpful to explain that the Admiralty, Commercial and Technology Commercial Court in the Rolls Building of the Royal Courts of Justice do not record whether the issued claims resulted in a hearing.
	Financial Year
	Commercial
	Foreign Parties involved
	Commercial Percentage of Foreign Cases
	Commercial - All Foreign Parties
	Commercial - Percentage of all Foreign Parties

	2008-09
	1075
	774
	72.00%
	
	

	2009-10
	1236
	929
	75.16%
	
	

	2010-11
	1063
	867
	81.56%
	
	

	2011-12
	1104
	898
	81.34%
	
	

	2012-13
	1188
	961
	80.89%
	582
	48.99%


It should be noted that a “foreign” party is deemed to be one whose address, as detailed on the claim form, is outside England and Wales. It should also be noted that the “all foreign” parties statistics are only available for the financial year period of 2012 to 2013 onwards.

In relation to country of origin I can confirm that Her Majesty’s Courts and Tribunals Service does not hold the information that you have requested. To establish whether the information was held I conducted a thorough search, and made enquires with the following area, Admiralty, Commercial and Technology Commercial Court in the Rolls Building at the Royal Courts of Justice within Her Majesty’s Courts and Tribunals Service.
If the information was held by MoJ it would have to be held by the above mentioned business area. It may help if I clarify that the information being requested is not held by MoJ because there is no legal or business requirement for the MoJ to do so.

Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless recorded information exists. The FOIA duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 


