Public Sector Equality Duty Consultation 2013
Vaughan Bruce’s response dated 14 March 2013

Call for evidence relating to the PSED

I am a wheelchair user and I am a 62 year old male.
The review is particularly focusing on the following key themes:

1. How well understood is the PSED and guidance

The process is clear but the requirements are ignored.

2. What are the costs and benefits of the PSED 

There are no specific costs. 

If the people conducting the recruitment process were operating the process objectively there would be more equality.  The White able-bodied majority regularly practise unlawful discrimination because disabled potential employees as seen as causing problems. 
Reputable Regulators such as The Law Society have lost Discrimination Claims brought against them.
 3. How Organisations are managing legal risk and ensuring compliance with the PSED
 My experiences of the appointment process are that the Equality legislation is ignored because the recruiters do not care about acting unlawfully. 
They know that their Managers will back them and taking Employment Tribunal (ET) proceedings is difficult. 
Furthermore the Government are introducing fees for commencing Tribunal and are seeking to remove the Questionnaire procedure by enacting Clause 58 of the Enterprise and Regulatory Reform Bill.
4. What changes would ensure better equality outcomes (legislative, administrative and/or enforcement changes, for example).

Immediately below is a recent FOI Response that I recently made relating to the number of wheelchair -user Judges employed by the Government.

They do not know the answer to that important question, which illustrates the indifference of this Government and previous Governments to the important issue of monitoring the composition of the judiciary.
Further representations to your questions are set out below the FOI Response which is below.
joanne peel

head of hr for the judiciary 

PROTECT - PERSONAL

V Bruce

Via email: synnott@talktalk.net
5th March 2013
Freedom of Information Request - 81020

Dear V Bruce,
Thank you for your email of 18th February 2013, in which you asked for the following information from the Ministry of Justice (MoJ):

“Please will you inform me Judges are wheelchair users and how many are not wheelchair users.”

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

I can confirm that the Ministry of Justice (MoJ) does not hold the information that you have requested.  When Judge’s are appointed they are not required to provide details of whether they are wheelchair users.  We would not hold this information on the judicial database.  

Please be advised that the FOIA does not oblige a public authority to create information to answer a request if the requested information is not held. It does not place a duty upon public authorities to answer a question unless recorded information exists. The FOIA duty is to only provide the recorded information held. 

You can find out more about information held for the purposes of the Act by reading some guidance points we consider when processing a request for information, attached at the end of this letter. 
You can also find more information by reading the full text of the Act, available at http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents and further guidance http://www.justice.gov.uk/guidance/foi-step-by-step.htm 

You have the right to appeal our decision if you think it is incorrect. Details can be found in the ‘How to Appeal’ section attached at the end of this letter.

Yours sincerely
[image: image1.emf]
Joanne Peel

How to Appeal

Internal Review

If you are not satisfied with this response, you have the right to an internal review. The handling of your request will be looked at by someone who was not responsible for the original case, and they will make a decision as to whether we answered your request correctly.

If you would like to request a review, please write or send an email to the Data Access and Compliance Unit within two months of the data of this letter, at the 

following address:

Data Access and Compliance Unit (10.34),

Information & Communications Directorate,

Ministry of Justice,

102 Petty France,

London

SW1H 9AJ

E-mail: data.access@justice.gsi.gov.uk
Information Commissioner’s Office

If you remain dissatisfied after an internal review decision, you have the right to apply to the Information Commissioner’s Office. The Commissioner is an independent regulator who has the power to direct us to respond to your request differently, if he considers that we have handled it incorrectly.

You can contact the Information Commissioner’s Office at the following address:

Information Commissioner’s Office,

Wycliffe House,

Water Lane,

Wilmslow,

Cheshire

SK9 5AF

Internet address: https://www.ico.gov.uk/Global/contact_us.aspx
EXPLANATION OF INFORMATION HELD FOR THE PURPOSES OF THE ACT

We have provided below additional information for information held for the purposes of the Freedom of Information Act. We have included some of the guidance we use when considering requests for information. I hope you find this information useful.

Is the information 'held' for the purposes of the Act? 

A person may request any information 'held' in any recorded form by a public authority (or held by another on behalf of a public authority). 

If the requester is asking for an opinion on an issue or asking for information that is not already held to be created, this is not a Freedom of Information Act request. 

Information covered by the Act 

All recorded information 'held' by a public authority is within the scope of the Freedom of Information Act. It includes files, letters, emails and photographs and extends to closed files and archived material. 

Recorded information 

The right of access applies to information recorded in any form. This includes: 

· information that is held electronically (such as on a laptop computer or an electronic records management system) 

· information that is recorded on paper (such as a letter, memorandum or papers in a file) 

· sound and video recordings (such as a CD or videotape) 

· hand-written notes or comments, including those written in note pads or on Post-it notes 

Is the information 'held' under the Freedom of Information Act? 

'Holding' information includes holding a copy of a record produced or supplied by someone else. However, if a public authority only holds information on behalf of someone else, for example a department holding trade union information on their computer system, then that public authority may not have to provide the information in response to a Freedom of Information Act request. 

In some cases, it may not be clear whether information which is physically present on your premises or systems is properly to be regarded as 'held' by your public authority, for the purposes of the Freedom of Information Act. Examples include: 

· private material brought into the office by ministers or officials 

· material belonging to other people or bodies 

· trade union material 

· constituency material 

material relating to party political matter
4. What changes would ensure better equality outcomes (legislative, administrative and/or enforcement changes, for example).

4.1 Abolishing fees for taking ET Claims.

4.2 Having many disabled Judges.
4.3 Reforming the Judicial appeal process.
At present, an Employment dispute is considered by an Employment tribunal. There is then a right of appeal to the Employment Appeal Tribunal. Thereafter an appeal can be pursued in the Court of Appeal and thereafter a further appeal to the Supreme Court thereafter a further appeal can be taken to the European Court of Human Rights. All of the above appeal procedures take a lengthy period of time and cost a substantial sum employing solicitors and barristers. 

Furthermore numerous judicial officers are employed at great public expense

Alternatively for other disputes there is the County Court/High Court, with subsequent appeals to the Court of Appeal and to the Supreme Court.

Reform is needed so that there is one first instance decision with only one right of appeal to a Court of Appeal and then the option of applying to the European Court of Human Rights. If this proposal is enacted, obtaining justice will become cheaper and quicker.

4.4 Public access to the Employment Tribunal data base of ET Decisions since the outcome of ET Decisions will be easily accessible. This will result in employers being more careful and trying to avoid discrimination and publicity.

4.5 Enacting legislation to make any Agreement which prohibits a former job applicant and/or a former employee from re-applying for work with that employer void and un-enforceable.
4.6 Legislation requiring all employers with 50 or more employees to annually publish all the Equality data e.g. number  of  employees sex, race, disability of age etc.

4.7 All ET hearings having a representative ET Panel member e.g. if the Claimant is a wheelchair user –having at a minimum one wheelchair user on the Panel.
Vaughan Bruce 

