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Thank you for your letter, in which you asked for the following information from Her Majesty’s Courts and Tribunals Service (HMCTS):

“I seek the following information for each of the following years – 2010, 2011 and 2012

Q1: Total number of Adult Criminal cases during 2012-appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent (not including Road Traffic cases)

Q2: Total number of Adult Criminal Cases at each of the following Magistrates Courts (not including Road Traffic cases);- 

Folkestone 

Dover 

Canterbury 

Margate 

Maidstone 

Medway 

Dartford 

Sevenoaks

Q3: Total number of imprisonable Adult Criminal cases appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent

Q4: Total Number of Youth Criminal Cases appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent

Q5: Total number of Youth Criminal cases at each of the following Magistrates Courts

Folkestone 

Dover 

Canterbury 

Margate 

Maidstone 

Medway 

Dartford 

Sevenoaks

Q6: In reference to question number one, please confirm 

i) the percentage of cases where Magistrates accept jurisdiction 

ii) percentage of cases where jurisdiction was declined
iii) percentage of cases where the defendant elected Crown Court Trial
Q7: Details of the boundary areas for each of the Courts in Kent as Listed above”

Your request has been handled under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 (FOIA).

Q1: Total number of Adult Criminal cases during 2012-appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent (not including Road Traffic cases)

I can confirm that the department holds information that you have asked for, and I am pleased to provide this to you. The information you have requested is in the table below. I have included figures for 2010 and 2011 because, in the paragraph preceding this question, you asked for “…information for each of the following years – 2010, 2011 and 2012…”

	Adult Criminal Completed Proceedings, excluding Summary Motoring Offences

	
	2012
	2011
	2010

	Kent
	11,749
	13,898
	16,228


For background information about these figures, please see the Explanatory Notes
Q2: Total number of Adult Criminal Cases at each of the following Magistrates Courts (not including Road Traffic cases): 
	· Folkestone
	· Canterbury
	· Maidstone 
	· Dartford 

	· Dover
	· Margate
	· Medway
	· Sevenoaks


I can confirm that the department holds some of the information that you have requested, and I provide this to you in the table below.
	Adult Criminal Completed Proceedings, excluding Summary Motoring Offences

	
	2012
	2011
	2010

	LJA: Central Kent

i.e. Maidstone and Sevenoaks
	4,197
	5,170
	5,818

	LJA: East Kent

i.e. Canterbury, Dover, Folkestone and Margate
	3,719
	4,495
	5,196

	LJA: North Kent

i.e. Medway (Chatham) and Dartford
	3,833
	4,233
	5,214


For background information about these figures, please see the Explanatory Notes
Q3: Total number of imprisonable Adult Criminal cases appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent

I can confirm that HMCTS does not hold the information that you have requested. To establish whether the information was held I made enquires with a colleague in our Performance Directorate, whose responsibilities includes statistical work.  I have been informed that data is not held in a way that allows us to collate it for all imprisonable offences. When assessing whether or not information was held, adequate and reasonable searches where made of statistical data.
I have suggested below the public authority which you may wish to direct your request to because they may hold information as they have the policy lead/or responsibility for the issue enquired about.  
You can also find more information by reading the full text of the Act, available at http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents. 
However, you may wish to contact Kent Police as they may hold some of the information you have asked for.  You can contact Kent Police at the following website:

http://www.kent.police.uk/about_us/foi/formal_request/Make%20a%20Request%20for%20I.html  
Alternatively, I have provided below, contact details for the Freedom of Information team
Freedom of Information Team
Data Protection Unit 
Kent Police, Force Headquarters 
Sutton Road
Maidstone

Kent, ME15 9BZ.

freedomofinformation@kent.pnn.police.uk 

You may also wish to contact the Crown Prosecution Service to see if they hold the information you have asked for.  You can contact the Crown Prosecution Service at the following website:

http://www.cps.gov.uk/foi/index.html 

Alternatively, you can contact the Crown Prosecution Service as follows:

The Freedom of Information Unit
CPS Headquarters
Rose Court
2 Southwark Bridge
London
SE1 9HS
FOIUnit@cps.gsi.gov.uk
Q4: Total Number of Youth Criminal Cases appearing at Magistrates Court across Kent

I can confirm that the department holds information that you have asked for, and I am pleased to provide this to you. The information you have requested is in the table below.
	All Youth Criminal Completed Proceedings

	
	2012
	2011
	2010

	Kent
	2,548
	3,078
	3,619


For background information about these figures, please see the Explanatory Notes
Q5: Total number of Youth Criminal cases at each of the following Magistrates Courts

I can confirm that the department holds some of the information that you have requested, and I provide this to you in the table below.

	· Folkestone
	· Canterbury
	· Maidstone 
	· Dartford 

	· Dover
	· Margate
	· Medway
	· Sevenoaks


	All Youth Criminal Completed Proceedings

	
	2012
	2011
	2010

	LJA: Central Kent

i.e. Maidstone and Sevenoaks
	701
	918
	1,035

	LJA: East Kent

i.e. Canterbury, Dover, Folkestone and Margate
	1,063
	1,222
	1,439

	LJA: North Kent

i.e. Medway (Chatham) and Dartford
	784
	938
	1,145


For background information about these figures, please see the Explanatory Notes
Q6: In reference to question number one, please confirm 

i) the percentage of cases where Magistrates accept jurisdiction 

ii) percentage of cases where jurisdiction was declined
iii) percentage of cases where the defendant elected Crown Court Trial
Magistrates decide whether to accept or decline jurisdiction in either way cases where the defendant has not pleaded guilty at a mode of trial hearing. If they accept jurisdiction the defendant can elect to be sent to the Crown Court for trial. A proportion of the cases referred to in Question 1 are not subject to a mode of trial hearing, so it is not possible to break them down in the way you have requested.
Q7: Details of the boundary areas for each of the Courts in Kent as Listed above

I have made enquires with the Crime Directorate (a part of the Ministry of Justice), and have also made enquiries with our administration for Kent’s magistrates’ courts.  
Having done so, I can tell you that Magistrates are appointed to LJAs and can only sit in those LJAs. Magistrates have jurisdiction to deal with any offence in England and Wales, but by convention deal with offences committed or charged in their LJA. I can also tell you that the LJAs in Kent comprise the geographical areas served by the local authorities listed in the table below:  
	For Central Kent LJA, the area served by …
	For East Kent LJA, the area served by ……
	For North Kent LJA, the area served by ……

	Tunbridge Wells Borough Council

http://www2.tunbridgewells.gov.uk/
	Canterbury City Council

https://www.canterbury.gov.uk/
	Medway Council, 

http://www.medway.gov.uk/ 



	Sevenoaks District Council

http://www.sevenoaks.gov.uk/
	Thanet District Council

http://www.thanet.gov.uk/
	Gravesham Borough Council

http://www.gravesham.gov.uk/ 



	Maidstone Borough Council

http://www.maidstone.gov.uk/
	Ashford Borough Council

http://www.ashford.gov.uk/
	Dartford Borough Council

http://www.dartford.gov.uk/ 



	Tonbridge and Malling District Council

http://www.tmbc.gov.uk/
	Dover District Council

http://www.dover.gov.uk/Home.aspx
	

	Swale Borough Council

http://www.swale.gov.uk/
	Shepway District Council

http://www.shepway.gov.uk/

	


We do not hold records (maps, for example) that I can provide to you.  If the information was held by HMCTS, or MoJ, it would have to be held by the Crime Directorate in MoJ, or the administration for Kent’s magistrates’ courts. The information is not held by HMCTS, or MoJ, because there is no legal or business requirement to hold the information. 

I have been able to release this information to you under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA).  I hope you find this information helpful to you.  You can also find more information by reading the full text of the Act (available at http://www.legislation.gov.uk/ukpga/2000/36/contents).
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